
Howard J. Barnett ' ^
Howard J. Barnett, 85, of ;.

Waterfall, passed away on :
Tuesday. Nov- 2, 1954, at »
2:20 p- m. at the home of his :
son-in-law and daughter Mr.
and Mrs. Jesse B. McClain, M
of Waterfall, after an illness
of four days.

The deceased was born on
October 13, 1869, at Water
fall, a son of Jonathan and
Harriet (Foot) Barnett. He
was united in marriage to £
Esther Knepper, June 23,
1896- She preceded him in
death.

Barnett was of the Metho
dist faith, and attended the
Center church in Taylor
township, Fulton county, for
many years. He was engaged
in farming in Taylor town
ship during his entire life.

These children survive:
Mrs. Jesse B. McClain, of
Waterfall. Mrs. Homer Stev
ens of Hiistotnown, Sebert
Barnett of Waterfall, Mrs-
Lewis Everts of Hancock, and
Mrs. Robert Brant of Laidig.
One daughter M'4s. Marshall j
McClain preceded him in
death. He is also survived by
one sister and one brother,
Mrs. Nellie Ramsey of Todd,
and Bruce Barnett of Coal-
mont.

Funeral services were held
Friday, November 5, at
10:30 a- m., in the Center
Methodist church, with Rev. I
Lloyd Bollinger, pastor of the
church officiating. Burial was
made in the adjoining ceme
tery.


